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 CHAPTER XI.  PUBLIC OFFENSES 
 

Article 1. Uniform Offense Code 
Article 2. Local Regulations 

 
 
 
 _________________________ 
 
 ARTICLE 1.  UNIFORM OFFENSE CODE 
 
11-101.  INCORPORATING UNIFORM PUBLIC OFFENSE CODE.  There is hereby 

incorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating public offenses within the 
corporate limits of the City of Ozawkie, Kansas, that certain code known as the 
"Uniform Public Offense Code."  Such code used shall always be the most current 
edition as prepared and published in book form by the League of Kansas 
Municipalities, Topeka, Kansas, save and except such articles, sections, parts or 
portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed.  No fewer than 
three copies of said Uniform Public Offense Code shall be marked or stamped 
"Official Copy as Incorporated by the Code of the City of Ozawkie, Kansas," with 
all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly marked 
to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of this 
section, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the 
public at all reasonable hours.  (Ord. 10-103, Sec. 1; Code 2007) 
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 ARTICLE 2.  LOCAL REGULATIONS 
  
11-201.   REMOVING BARRICADES. That it shall be unlawful for any person or 

persons to remove, throw down, run over, or interfere with any barricade or 
barricades erected by the City, or any contractor executing a municipal contract, 
placed to guard and protect any grading, paving, sidewalk construction or other 
public work, and any person or persons who shall violate the provisions of this 
Section shall, upon conviction thereof, be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor. 
(Ord. 4-428c; Code 2007) 

 
11-202.  MOLESTING UNFINISHED PAVING.  That no person or persons shall walk 

upon, drive or ride over or across any pavement, in course of construction before 
the same has been opened for public travel, any uncompleted grading, or sidewalk 
construction which has not been opened for travel.  (10-203; Code 2007) 

 
11-203.  POSTING BILLS.  That no person shall put up any hand bills, 

advertisements, posters, show bills, or other sign on any building, pole, or property 
not his own, without permission from the owner thereof.  (10-210; Code 2007) 

 
11-204.  RIDING VEHICLES ON SIDEWALK.  That no person shall ride or cause to 

be ridden upon the sidewalks of this City, any vehicle, including bicycles and 
motorcycles.  (10-215; Code 2007) 

 
11-205.  EXPLOSIVES; DISPOSAL OF.  That it shall he unlawful for any person, firm 

or corporation to sell, give away or otherwise dispose of any detonating explosive 
without keeping a record as required by law. It shall also be unlawful for any 
person, firm or corporation to sell, give away or otherwise dispose of any of the 
explosives named above to any intoxicated or irresponsible person; and when said 
explosives shall lawfully be in the possession of any person, firm or corporation, 
they shall be handled in accordance with the general Statutes of Kansas, and no 
person having in his possession any explosives, shall carry the same in a wholly or 
partially, concealed manner on or about his person.  (Code 2007) 

 
11-206.  STORAGE. OF EXPLOSIVES.  It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or 

corporation to bring into, keep or store, within the corporate limits of the City of 
Ozawkie, modern gun powder, or black powder (for ammunition loading purposes) 
in quantities of more than fifteen (15) pounds, or dynamite or other  explosives in 
“ANY” quantity.  (Code 2007) 


